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This Hour Has Seven Days 

Sun 10:00-11:00 p.m., 4 Oct 1964-9 May 1965 Sun 10:00-11:00 p.m., 3 Oct 
1965-8 May 1966 

Executive producers Douglas Leiterman and Patrick Watson 
outlined their initial plans for what became the most famous and 
notorious series in the history of CBC television, This Hour Has 
Seven Days, in a manifesto that proposed: 

On Sundays at l0:00 p.m., a one-hour show of such vitality and urgency that it will 
recapture public excitement in public affairs television and become mandatory 
viewing for a large segment of the nation. 

Describing the show's scope, they wrote: 

Items can qualify in terms of urgency, controversy, national interest, human 
condition, satire, beauty or art. Seven Days will range Canada and the world. 
Reporter-cameraman teams will pounce on significant events wherever they 
occur, looking not only at the news but at the reasons behind it. 

Their proposal was marked with overreaching ambition, but it also brimmed with 
enthusiasm and drive, and described with remarkable foresight the shape of the 
show. 

Leiterman had worked for the CBC since 1957, after training as a newspaper 
reporter in Vancouver, and had been closely involved with the network's main 
public affairs broadcasts, including Close Up and Background. Most recently, he 
had produced Document, the series that had formed the centre of the CBC's 
involvement in direct cinema filmmaking. Watson had been with the CBC since 
1956 (though he had started as a radio actor when he was a teenager) and, like 
Leiterman, had worked for Close Up, as well as producing and contributing to 
other programs, including Mr. Fixit, Tabloid, and Junior Magazine. Most recently, 
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he had produced the hard-hitting interview show, Inquiry, where he had 
collaborated with two men who would also play major rol



at local CBC. In addition, the show permitted viewers to phone in their comments 
to the show's hosts. 

Finally, Seven Days was also to provide a network venue for more creative "film 
essays" and for items from foreign news and public affairs television sources. 
While the CBC had long provided public affairs coverage for Canadian television 
viewers, it is clear that the ambition and international scope that underscored the 
Seven Days project indicated that the network intended to produce world-class 
television. 

A number of other factors led to the turning point in public affairs television that 
Seven Days represented. Canadians had already made programs such as Close-
Up and Tabloid television staples, and made stars of announcers and 
interviewers, including J. Frank Willis, Percy Saltzman, and Joyce Davidson. 
Television news was also building importance for its coverage of such 
developments as the elections that made John Diefenbaker and Lester Pearson 
our first TV-era heads of government. With the l960 Presidential election in the 
United States and the coverage of the Kennedy assassination and its aftermath in 
1963, U.S. network news--to which Canadian viewers along the border could 
tune--was propelled into a new stage in its evolution, which was marked not only 
by the breadth of its coverage but by the depth of its penetration, where its 
success was measured not only by the quality of reporting in the Edward R. 
Murrow tradition, but also by the numbers of audiences in the ratings war 
between Walter Cronkite and Huntley-Brinkley. Television news offered a 
vantage and shaped public views of such developments as the Quiet Revolution 
in Quebec, as well as such international developments as the Cuban missile 
crisis and other elements of the Cold War, the civil rights movement in the U.S.A., 
and the Vietnam War. Developments in popular and mass culture, such as the 
folk music revival and the currency of satirical comedy (such as Mort Sahl, Lenny 
Bruce, and Vaughn Meader's "First Family" records in the U.S., and Beyond The 
Fringe and David Frost's BBC-TV series, That Was The Week That Was in the 
U.K.) indicated the level of conscience and awareness in audiences, and the 
different means by which news could be transmitted. 

The CBC gained impetus to revamp its schedule and hype its programming to 
compete with the still new broadcasting organization, CTV. The private network 
had challenged CBC's Sunday night public affairs programming with its own 
show, Telepoll, and had lured veteran Southam reporter Charles Lynch away. (A 
year later, CTV would also attract Peter Reilly away from the CBC to create and 
produce W5, a show that competed more directly for viewers of Seven Days.) For 
two turbulent seasons, however, Seven Days assembled the news and current 
events into a variegated magazine that for many Canadians--over three million 





The so-called Seven Days Crisis involved the friction between CBC management 
and the show's own producers and methods of production. (See Helen 
Carscallen, "Control in a Broadcasting System," M.A. Thesis, University of 
Toronto, 1966--an invaluable source.) Seven Days was itself devoted to the idea 
that news and public affairs were vital, controversial, and often confrontational. 
During the testing period of the first season, the Seven Days production style 
strained the established bureaucracy and standards of the CBC, and at various 
times H.G. Walker, General Manager of the English Networks, and Reeves 
Haggan, General Supervisor of Public Affairs, prohibited sensitive items from 
broadcast. Before the opening show, for example, they vetoed a segment on the 
upcoming Royal visit to Quebec. A satirical sketch, which depicted the Queen as 
a housewife with hair in curlers, was deemed inappropriate, and a sequence of 
interviews with Quebec citizens on the subject of the monarchy was quashed 
without being screened. 

Seven Days played a major part in bringing to public attention issues that had 
been suppressed or taboo both in television and society as a whole. As such, it 
exemplified the informational and cultural revolution that erupted in the 1960s, 
and paid a price for its adventurous stance. The issues that caused the greatest 
dispute were, all too predictably, the subjects that polite people avoided 
discussing simply in order to keep peace at the dinner table, because they were 
the subjects that commanded the strongest and most deeply rooted opinions: 
politics, sex, and religion. For Canada, this meant the specific cases of Quebec 
nationalism, developing sexual freedoms represented most explicitly by the birth 
control pill, and specific cases such as the Munsinger scandal and the Horsburgh 
affair. 

In November 1964, the show planned a report on the case of United Church 
minister Russell Horsburgh, who was charged and ultimately convicted of 
contributing to juvenile delinquency for encouraging sexual relations among 
young churchgoers in Chatham, Ontario. The story was scheduled to air between





left a job in civic administration in Ohio to join the staff. Lefolii had formerly worked 
as editor of Maclean's. 



As if that were not enough, however, the first Seven Days of the season 
encountered added controversy over a different type of issue. With Pope Paul VI 
scheduled to visit New York the next day, and deliver a mass at Yankee Stadium 
during his stay, Seven Days included a sketch in which network television 



Washington, D.C. on the grounds that it was the responsibility of the network 



the taboos and exoticism that the corporation was trying to tone down. Alan 
Edmonds wrote: 

The methods Seven Days has used to attract its mass audience have left The 
Corporation (which is what its employees call the CBC) in the position of genteel, 
bourgeois parent who produced a rambunctious, intellectual vulgarian--and are 
ashamed of the fact. 

...It doesn't pontificate; it agitates and irritates. It is impossible to simply watch it; 
you become involved in it, and even when it's lousy (and it can be as bad as it 
can be magnificent) it remains, for millions who would otherwise switch channels 
at the start of a public affairs show, something to talk about come Monday. You 
watch it to see what it will come up with next--just to see whether there's another 
Pope sketch..., or to see whether Laurier LaPierre will lose his temper (as he did 
once when interviewing opposing groups of French- and English-Canadian 
students), or Pat Watson his unflappable urbanity. (p. 9) 

Maybe LaPierre did not lose his temper, but he did cry. He watched an item on 
the trial of Steven Truscott, a fourteen year old Ontario boy when he was 
convicted of killing a girl. The report included a discussion with Isabel LeBourdais, 
the writer of a recent book that disputed the verdict, and an interview with Steven 
Truscott's mother. When the film segment ended and the cameras turned to 
LaPierre at his desk, he had to wipe away a tear before he could continue. The 



film with the help of the Westmount police, but Zolf was bringing the evidence 
back to Toronto. Although the story itself was clearly of interest--whether it 
actually had anything to do with the Munsinger affair, it did concern a violent 
outburst by a Government official--the producers decided not to air the footage 
the next night. After the incident, Svigny read a prepared statement to CBC 
cameras, and later discussed Munsinger with a reporter. (See Leiterman, pp. l0-ll) 
Seven Days had four items on the Munsinger affair, but the only one to air on the 
show of 20 March, while the story was still current, was an interview with some 
Upper Canada College students on the subject. The Svigny footage, one of the 
three segments to be scotched was seen by management to constitute an 
invasion of privacy and contravene CBC policy. 

Finally, the issue of Laurier LaPierre's and Warner Troyer's interview with Qubec 
Attorney-General Claude Wagner precipitated a series of ultimatums that would 
result in the final chapter in the life of Seven Days. LaPierre's position against 
capital punishment was evident, producer Leiterman agreed (Carscallen, p. l3l), 
and he and Troyer both took adversary positions in order to draw a strong 
argument for the Qubec government view out of Wagner. Nevertheless, LaPierre 
was seen to have dominated the interview, a situation that he attributed to the 



Late that night, with several weeks left in the television season and Seven Days 
reportedly enjoying over three million viewers, about one-third of the viewing 



"The Lesson of Seven Days," Canadian Forum (May 1966), pp. 25-26; Eric Koch, 
Inside Seven Days (Toronto: Prentice-Hall, 1986). 

Photo (courtesy of CBC) shows Bob Hoyt, Ken Lefolii, Doug Leiterman, Patrick Watson. 

 

This Is Ottawa 

Tue 10:00-10;30 p.m., 3 Jul-7 Aug 1956 

Broadcast live from Ottawa and produced by Michael Hind-Smith, this series of 
six, half-hour programs featured on-the-spot reports by Robert McKeown from the 
nation's capital. The show visited the Supreme Court Building for a look at the 
National Capital Plan, a model of the city for the future, Laurier House, the 
National Gallery, the Dominion Bureau of Statistics, the Embassy of France, and 
the Parliament Buildings. 

 

This Is The Law 

Mon 8:30-9:00 p.m., 21 Jun-13 Sep 1971 Mon 9:30-10:00 p.m., 3 Jul 1972- Mon 
9:30-10:00 p.m., 17 Sep 1973-24 Jun 1974 Mon 8:30-9:00 p.m., 9 Sep 1974-1 
Sep 1975 Tue 8:30-9:00 p.m., 9 Sep 1975-6 Apr 1976 Mon-Fri 4:00-4:30 p.m., 11 

Jun-7 Sep 1979 (R) Mon-Fri 1:30-2:00 p.m., 26 May-21 Aug 1981 
(R) 

This Is The Law started as a summer replacement, in 197l and l972, 
for Front Page Challenge, and proved popular enough to earn a 

prime time slot of its own in the 1972 season. Another half- hour quiz show with 
an underlying educational premise, it asked panel members to spot the obscure 
statute that was violated in a filmed, wordless sketch. Paul Soles played the 
hapless lawbreaker and Robert Warner the constable (from 1974, when he was 
promoted, the sergeant) who put the arm on him after the deed was done. Other 
members of the repertory company who played supporting parts in the sketches 
included Paul Bradley, Robert McHeady, Dougal Fraser, Eric Clavering, Monica 
Parker, Valri Bromfield, Trudy Desmond, and Jo Penny. 

The panelists were Hart Pomerantz, himself a barrister and solicitor, though 
better known to CBC audiences as one half of the comic team from The Hart and 
Lorne Terrific Hour, broadcasters and actors Larry Solway and Madeleine 
Kronby, and acerbic businessman William Charlton. Kronby left the show 
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effective August 197l, and was later replaced by Susan Keller. fIn addition to 



Jun-25 Aug 1980 Mon-Fri 1:30-2:00 p.m., 26 May-18 Jul 1980 (R) Mon 10:30-
11:00 p.m., 8 Sep-22 Sep 1980 Mon 10:00-11:00 p.m., 15 Jun- Mon 10:30-11:00 
p.m., 29 Jun-31 Aug 1981 Thu 2:00-2:30 p.m., 28 May-10 Sep 1981 (R) Sat 
10:30-11:00 p.m., 5 Jun- Tue 10:30-11:00 p.m., 6 Jul-31 Aug 1982 

After the acclaimed series of documentaries on nature and resources, This Land 
Of Ours, moved into a prime time slot for a summer season with a new host, it 
stayed there and expanded to a one hour format. (It later retracted to a half-hour, 
though it stayed as a regular and welcome addition to the prime time schedule.) 
The adjustment in the show's title reflected the broadened scope of the program, 
as well as the departure of host John Foster, who had been identified with the 
earlier show. 

One of the principal television outlets to explore environmental issues and 
policies of conservation, This Land evolved as the central production of the CBC 
Agriculture and Resources department. The series opened with programs on 
pollution, and introduced the importance that music would play in the show, with 
songs by Dee Higgins, Brent Titcombe, and Bruce Cockburn to illustrate the 
discussion. Although the program was in one sense devoted to celebrating the 
land in visual terms, it also carried a strong sense of commitment to the social 
issues of the environmental movement, and consequently documented conflict as 
well as the harmony of nature. 

Frequent contributors to the show have included naturalist Tommy Tompkins, 
reporter Stanley Burke, arctic authority Doug Wilkinson, Bruno Engler, and Dr. 
Donald Chant. The executive producers of This Land were Murray Creed (l970-
7l) and John Lackie (l97l-86), and the contributing producers included Lackie and 
Foster, Neil Andrews, Terry Richardson, Jack Kellum, Bob Hutt, David Fulton, 
Eric McLeery, Robert Fripp, Ray Burley, Garnett Anthony, Dick Donovan, John 
LaPointe, Ed Sanders, and Dave Quinton. The hosts were John Hopkins (l970-
72) and Phyllis Gorman (l970-7l), Laurie Jennings (l973-78), Mary Chapman 
(l976- 78), John Foster (l977), Mike Halleran (l977), and Don Francks (l978-82). 

Through the late 1970s and 1980s, the costs of producing the kind of location 
documentaries that This Land demanded grew and the show's budget eroded. 
Each year saw fewer and fewer new shows in the series, and the program ended 
in 1986. 



Sat 6:00-6:30 p.m., 8 Jan-26 Mar 1966 Sat 6:00-6:30 p.m., 7 Jan-25 Mar 1967 
Sat 6:00-6:30 p.m., 7 Oct 1967-30 Mar 1968 Sat 6:00-6:30 p.m., 7 Dec 1968-31 
May 1969 Sun 5:00-5:30 p.m., 4 Jan-29 Mar 1970 Tue 10:30-11:00 p.m., 7 Jul-1 
Sep 1970 

This Land Of Ours replaced Countrytime and, as the change in title suggested, 
represented an expansion of the vision of what the Farms Department might 
contribute. Issues of the human uses of nature grew beyond farms and fishing to 
include other forms of resources. Fuelled by the germinating environmental 
movement and by the self-examination that the Centennial celebrations focused, 
This Land Of Ours started as a thirteen week series of half-hour programs that 
aimed to explore issues of agriculture and renewable resources. (The show's title 
came from the theme song, "Something to Sing About," performed by the 
Travellers.) Over the show's four and a half year history, before it was 
transformed into This Land, it presented many distinguished documentaries that 
showed us our rural and natural heritage, as well as feeding our appetites for 
nature and science information television. 

Each program in the first series concentrated on a specific resource, such as 
agriculture, fishing, forestry, water and soil, and wildlife, and included both film 
segments and studio sequences with discussions and demonstrations. Programs 
concentrated on such subjects as a visit by suburban Toronto students to the 
Albion Hills Conservation School; the Northern native people and their 
dependence on the goose as a food source; and pollution in the river and lake 
systems of southern Ontario. 

The host of This Land Of Ours was John Foster, who had started as a 
commentator on farms with CFTO-TV in Toronto and moved to the CBC in 1962. 
Subsequently, for his work on This Land Of Ours and its successor, as well as his 
highly successful series, To The Wild Country, produced with his wife Janet 
Foster, he has become one of the country's best known producers and voices for 
issues of nature, the environment, and nature on television. 

Producers for the show included Murray Creed (l966-67), Jim St. Maire (l967-68), 
John Lackie (l968-70), Gerry Richardson, and Jack Kellum. 

 

This Living World 



Thu 5:00-5:30 p.m., 10 Oct 1959-16 Jun 1960 Sat 5:00-5:30 p.m., 21 Oct 1961-
18 Aug 1962 Mon 5:30-6:00 p.m., 1 Oct 1962-27 May 1963 Mon 4:00-4:30 p.m., 
14 Oct 1963-25 May 1964 

This half-hour, afternoon program for young people adapted for the English CBC 
audience the formula of the Radio-Canada series, La Vie qui bat. Both were 
produced by Adelin 



The next summer, This Week returned. Although the program had a different 
format and host, it still had ties with The Public Eye. Don Cumming was the 
show's executive producer for the first half of the eight week series, and Richard 
Nielsen for the second half. Don McNeill produced the show, which actor Don 
Harron hosted. Essentially an interview program, This Week concentrated on 
such subjects as the Miami convention of the U.S. Republican Party and the 
violent Chicago convention of the Democrats; the growing liberalism and its 
ultimate suppression in Czechoslovakia; and the national leader of the New 
Democratic Party, David Lewis. 

 

This Week 

See This Week In Parliament. 

 

This Week In Parliament 

Sun 10:00-11:00 a.m., 23 Oct-18 Dec 1977 Sun 5:00-6:00 p.m., 29 Jan- Sun 
5:20-6:00 p.m., 15 Oct 1978-



The CBC tried to respond to the growing youth movement and market with 
Through The Eyes Of Tomorrow, a magazine show that included music, variety, 
and drama, as well as coverage of current affairs and social issues. The hosts of 
the program, which ran a full hour in its first season, were Paul Saltzman, then a 
student at the University of Toronto and formerly a researcher for This Hour Has 
Seven Days, and Janet McQuillin, a recent graduate of York University and a 
CBC radio researcher and writer. Each program concentrated on a particular 
subject or area. The first program concerned music, with appearances by jazz 
drummer Ed Thigpen, composer Aaron Charloff, and a folk music group, the 
Mark IIIs. Subsequent programs included Saltzman's interview with actor Peter 
Kastner and a panel discussion with Globe and Mail columnist Richard J. 



contemporary west. Other productions included Nishihata's Behaviourism, 
Hamilton's American Gothic '69, a report from the Nixon U.S. heartland, and 
Graham's The Left In Canada. In addition, the program presented Michael 
Maclear's production, Ho Chi Minh's People, his report on North Vietnam at the 
time of Ho's death, when Maclear was the only western news representative in 
the country. After one season, the documentary program moved to Tuesdays, 
and changed its title. See Tuesday Night. 

 


